
Message 

From: 

Sent: 
To: 

Subject: 

Chris, 

David l. Esparza [/O=INGLEWOOD/OU=EXCHANGE ADMINISTRATIVE GROUP 

(FYDIBOHF23SPDLT)/CN=RECIPIENTS/CN=E108232A17E74FFEB98331378CD8FCD6-DAVID l. ESPAR] 

1/29/2020 2:29:37 PM 

Chris Holmquist [CHolmquist@wilsonmeany.com] 

RE: Murphy's Bowl Reimbursement 

I'll look into right away. Thanks for the notice. 
David 

From: Chris Holmquist [mailto:CHolmquist@wilsonmeany.com] 
Sent: Wednesday, January 29, 2020 2:25 PM 
To: David L. Esparza <dlesparza@cityofinglewood.org> 
Cc: Emi Maruyama <emim@ballmergroup.com>; Gloria Chacon <GChacon@wilsonmeany.com> 
Subject: Murphy's Bowl Reimbursement 

Hello David: 

We have not received a letter from the City requesting reimbursement of fees per the attached letter. 

Best, 

Chris Holmquist 
Wilson Meany 
6701 Center Drive, Suite 950 
Los Angeles, CA 90045 

Phone: (310) 382-9023 
Mobile: (415) 298-3230 


