Message

From:
Sent:
To:

CC:

Subject:

Hey Raul,

Adrian Huerta [AdrianH@CBelow.com]

8/26/2020 6:10:19 PM

Raul Fernandez [/o=inglewood/ou=Exchange Administrative Group
(FYDIBOHF23SPDLT)/cn=Recipients/cn=5e201215d6324ca6a7a89b6eal07964e-Raul Fernandez]

Paul Lopez [/o=Inglewood/ou=Exchange Administrative Group
(FYDIBOHF23SPDLT)/cn=Recipients/cn=c3028f5addc64346bb7¢320ba74881e2-Paul Lopez]; Jose J. Ramirez
[/o=Inglewood/ou=Exchange Administrative Group
(FYDIBOHF23SPDLT)/cn=Recipients/cn=d513fc0b82b54ff7ac40d1e846ff087c-Jose J. Ramire]; Boytrese Osias
[/o=Inglewood/ou=Exchange Administrative Group
(FYDIBOHF23SPDLT)/cn=Recipients/cn=fd61c0e8a5ff4d30a30b301c37110f76-Boytrese Osias]; Hector Vargas
[HectorV@CBelow.com]

RE: 10023 S Prairie and others pothole for utilities Clippers Arena

Permit payment was mailed out today, would you please email me a receipt once it is processed? Please let me know if
there is anything else you need.

Best Regards,
Adrian Huerta

Assistant Project Manager
cell 909.315.9625 | office 909-993-1370 ext. 509

C Below | Subsurface Imaging | www chelow.com
Utility Investigations | Potholing | Mapping [ CCTV | GPR

Serving SoCal # Chino ¢ Eastvale « San Diego

From: Raul Fernandez <rfernandez@cityofinglewood.org>

Sent: Tuesday, August 25, 2020 4:40 PM

To: Adrian Huerta <AdrianH@CBelow.com>

Cc: Paul Lopez <plopez@cityofinglewood.org>; Jose J. Ramirez <jramirez@cityofinglewood.org>; Boytrese Osias
<bosias@cityofinglewood.org>

Subject: 10023 S Prairie and others pothole for utilities Clippers Arena

Attached is the now issued permit for the subject work

Please call 310 412-5333 to schedule inspections

Notify all affected property owners 72-hours prior to start of work
Assist with any Trash-pick-up activities

“Include a copy of the Invoice with your payment”

Mail check payment made out to: City of Inglewood to:



Raul Fernandez

City of Inglewood

Public Works Department, 3rd Floor
One W. Manchester Bivd.
Inglewood, CA 90301

Thank you,

Raul Fernandez

City of Inglewood

Public Works Department
310 330-5748

From: Adrian Huerta [imailio:AdrianH@ CRelow.com]
Sent: Tuesday, August 25, 2020 11:49 AM

To: Raul Fernandez <rfgrnandez@cityofinglewood.org>
Subject: 2020-PLC-372 C Below Permit Approved

Hey Raul,
Attached is the approved pothole and traffic control plans. Please let me know if there is anything else you need.

Best Regards,
Adrian Huerta

Assistant Project Manager
cell 909.315.9625 | office 909-993-1370 ext. 509

C Below | Subsurface Imaging | www.chelow com
Utility Investigations | Potholing | Mapping | CCTV [ GPR

Serving SoCal » Chino ¢ Eastvale ¢ San Diego



