Message

From: Mindala Wilcox [/O=Inglewood/OU=CITY/cn=Recipients/cn=mwilcox]

on behalf of  Mindala Wilcox

Sent: 4/10/2018 12:44:29 PM

To: Sharon Koike [/O=Inglewood/0OU=CITY/cn=Recipients/cn=spitpit]

CC: Christopher E. Jackson [/O=Inglewood/OU=CITY/cn=Recipients/cn=cejackson]
Subject: FW: Clippers: Murphy's Bow! Funding Agreements Reporting Request 2

Attachments: 180301 M Wilcox Funding Agreement 18-055 Reporting Request 2.pdf; 180301 M Wilcox Funding Agreement 18-059
Reporting Request 2.pdf

Hi Sharon,
Just following up on the attached. Did you receive or pay invoices during the requested time period?

Respectfully,
dindy Wilcox, AICP : Planning Manager : City of Inglewood

Fconomic and Community Development Department
Planning Division : One Manchester Boulevard © Inglewoond, CA 20301
V310 412-5230 ¢ F{310) 412-5681 . mwilcox@citvofinglewood.org

EXCELLENCE in Public Service. QOMMITMEN'?' to Problem Solving. mETERMiNATION to Succeed.

PLEASE CONSIDER THE ENVIRONRMERNT BEFORE PRINTING THIS BEIAL.

From: Mindala Wilcox

Sent: Friday, March 16, 2018 3:35 PM

To: Sharon Koike <skoike @cityofinglewood.org>

Subject: FW: Clippers: Murphy's Bowl Funding Agreements Reporting Request 2

Good day Sharon,
Attached is the reporting request from Murphy's Bowl Can i get copies of any invoices paid for Murphy's
Bowl? Thanks.

Respeactiully,
AMindy Wilcox, AICP : Planning Manager : City of Inglewood

Economic and Community Development Department
Planning Division : One Manchester Boulevard | Inglewnod, CA 80301
VIZ10) 412-52330 : F{310) 412-5681 : mwilcox@cityofinglewood.org

EXCEL.LENCE in Public Service, QOMMITMENT to Problem Solving. mETERMiNATION 1o Succeed.

PLEASE CONSIDER THE ENVIRONMIENT BEFORE PRINTING THIS EMalL.

From: Chris Holmquist [mailto:CHolmouist@ wilsonmeany,.com|

Sent: Thursday, March 1, 2018 11:57 AM

To: Mindala Wilcox <mwilcon@citvofinglewood.org>

Cc: Gerard McCallum <GReCallum@wilsonmeany.com>; Christopher E. Jackson <geiackson@citvoiinglewood.org>
Subject: Clippers: Murphy's Bowl Funding Agreements Reporting Request 2

Hello Mindy:



Please find attached Reporting Request No 2 for Funding Agreements 18-055 and 18-059.

Thank you,

Chris Holmquist

Wilson Meany

6701 Center Drive, Suite 950
Los Angeles, CA 90045

Phone: (310) 382-9023
Mobile: (415) 298-3230



