
Message 

From: 
on behalf of 
Sent: 
To: 
CC: 
Subject: 

Mindala Wilcox [/O=lnglewood/OU=CITY/cn=Recipients/cn=mwilcox] 
Mindala Wilcox 
5/9/2018 10:23:44 AM 
'Chris Holmquist' [CHolmquist@wilsonmeany.com] 

Gloria Chacon [GChacon@wilsonmeany.com]; Evangeline lane [/O=lnglewood/OU=CITY /cn=Recipients/cn=elane] 
RE: Clippers/ Murphy's Bowl llC Funding Agreement 18-055, Phase 2, Payment letter of Transmittal 

Thanks Chris. We will send you a copy of the receipt shortly. 

Respectfully, 

Mindy Wikox, AICP: Planning Manager: City of Inglewood 
Economic and Community Development Department 
Planning Division: One Manchester Boulevard: Inglewood, CA 90301 
V(310) 412-5230: F{310) 412-5681: ffl1_iY_il_[;_()_)(_@_t:_itygfi_11_g_l~~\/_9.Q_cl_:9Xg 

ExcELLENCE in Public Service. CmvHV11TfV1El\JT lo Problem Solving. DETERMll\JATIOl\J to Succeed. 

PLEASE CONSlnER THE EN\llROl\IMENT BEFORE PRINTING THIS EMAIL 

From: Chris Holmquist [mailto:CHolmquist@wilsonmeany.com] 
Sent: Wednesday, May 9, 2018 9:12 AM 
To: Mindala Wilcox <mwilcox@cityofinglewood.org> 
Cc: Gloria Chacon <GChacon@wilsonmeany.com> 
Subject: Clippers I Murphy's Bowl LLC Funding Agreement 18-055, Phase 2, Payment Letter of Transmittal 

Hello Mindy: 

Attached is a copy of the letter of transmittal that shows that we delivered Murphy's Bowl LLC Check No. 10116 to the 
City on 05/07 /18. 

Best, 

Chris Holmquist 
Wilson Meany 
6701 Center Drive, Suite 950 
Los Angeles, CA 90045 

Phone: (310) 382-9023 
Mobile: (415) 298-3230 


