Message

From: Mindala Wilcox [/O=Inglewood/OU=CITY/cn=Recipients/cn=mwilcox]
on behalf of Mindala Wilcox

Sent: 2/15/2018 6:28:49 PM

To: Sharon Koike [/O=Inglewood/0OU=CITY/cn=Recipients/cn=spitpit]
Subject: RE: Murphy's Bowl!: Invoice payment

Thanks

Respectiully,
Mindy Wilcox, AICP : Planning Manager : City of Inglewood
Economic and Community Development Department

Planning Division : One Manchester Boulevard | Inglewood, CA 30301
WV{310) 412-5230 : F{310) 412-5681 : mwilcox@citvotinelewood.org

EXCELLENCE in Public Service., QOMMITMENT to Frobiem Solving. BETERMENATION 1o Succeed,

PLEASE CONSIDER THE ENVIRONRERT BEFORE PRINTING THIS BEIAL.

From: Sharon Koike

Sent: Thursday, February 15, 2018 6:29 PM

To: Mindala Wilcox <mwilcox@cityofinglewood.org>
Subject: RE: Murphy's Bowl: Invoice payment

Sure. | will get hack to you

From: Mindala Wilcox

Sent: Thursday, February 15, 2018 6:00 PM

To: Sharon Koike <skoike@icitvoflinglewood.org>
Subject: Murphy's Bowl: Invoice payment

Hi Sharon,

We received a request from Murphy’s Bowl, LLC per agreement 18-055 and 18-059 to receive copies of all consultant
invoices paid under these agreements as of January 31, 2018. The account the payments would have come from is
300.100.A003.

Can you tell me if any invoices were paid between 12/19/2017-1/31/2018 from this account? Thanks.

Respectfully,
Mindy Wilcox, AICP : Planning Manager : City of Inglewood

Economic and Community Development Department
Planning Division : One Manchester Boulevard : Inglewood, CA 90301
V(310) 412-5230 : F(310) 412-5681 : mwilcox@cityofinglewood.org

EXCELLENCE in Public Service. COMMITMENT to Problem Solving. DETERMINATION to Succeed.

PLEASE CONSIDER THE ENVIRONRMERNT BEFORE PRINTING THIS BEIAL.




