Message

From: Louis A. Atwell [latwell @cityofinglewood.org]

Sent: 11/15/2018 10:21:26 AM

To: Chris Holmquist [CHolmquist@wilsonmeany.com]

CC: Lisa Trifiletti (lisa@trifiletticonsulting.com) [lisa@trifiletticonsulting.com]

Subject: Re: Hollywood Park Historic Soil Remediation Costs for Retail Area of Western Parking Lot

Thank you Chris! You are the best!
Sent from my iPhone, so please excuse my mizpellings ©

On Nov 15, 2018, at 10:12 AM, Chris Holmquist <CHolmauist@wilsonmesny.com> wrote:

Hello Louis:
Here is a summary of our soil remediation costs in the Retail Area of Hollywood Park.
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Chris Holmgquist

Wilson Meany

6701 Center Drive, Suite 950
Los Angeles, CA 90045

Phone: (310) 382-9023
Mobile: (415) 298-3230



