
Message 

From: 

Sent: 
To: 

Subject: 

Christina Erwin [/O=ESA/OU=EXCHANGE ADMINISTRATIVE GROUP 
(FYDIBOHF23SPDLT)/CN=RECIPIENTS/CN=CHRISTINA ERWINA70] 
2/12/2018 1:38:05 PM 
Brian Boxer [/o=Exchangelabs/ou=Exchange Administrative Group 
(FYDIBOHF23SPDLT)/cn=Recipients/cn=a4f8c4ab743d4d5194aa8b3d8c519c29-Brian Boxer]; Mindy Wilcox 
(mwilcox@cityofinglewood.org) [mwilcox@cityofinglewood.org] 

RE: Invoice 

Correct .. we have not yet sent an invoice. I have a draft invoice in front of me, and I anticipate sending it to you in the 
next week or so, in line with the specific requirements outlined in the contract. 

~::.SA [ nv1ronnwntal See nee A.ssnciates 

From: Brian Boxer <.!?..!?..9.~.§.f..@.~.~.9..?..?..Q.~.e.\??..m.> 
Date: February 12, 2018 at 12:59:47 PM PST 
To: Mindala Wilcox <mwilcox@citvoflnglewood.org> 
Cc: 
Subject: Re: Invoice 

Mindy, no, I don't think we've sent an invoice yet. I'm copying Christina to confirm. 

BB 

Brian D. Boxer, AICP 
Northern California Regional Director 
916-761-2288 
bboxer@esassoccom 

On Feb 12, 2018, at 11:13 AM, Mindala Wilcox <mwilcox@dtvoflnglewood.org> wrote: 

Hi Brian, 
I was looking through my records and I could not find any invoices yet from ESA. I just wanted to confirm that you 
haven't sent one yet. Thanks. 

Respectfully, 

Mindy Wilcox, AICP: Planning Manager: City of Inglewood 
Economic and Community Development Department 
Planning Division: One Manchester Boulevard: Inglewood, CA 90301 
V{310) 412-5230: F{310) 412-5681: mwilcox@cityofinglewood.org 

ExcELLENCE in Public Service. COMMITMENT to Problem Solving. DETERMINATION to Succeed. 

PLEASE COMSIDER THE EMVlRONMEMT BEFORE PRIMTIMG THIS EMAIL. 


