
Message 

From: 

Sent: 
To: 

Subject: 

Thanks Mindy! 

Cheryl Moore [/O=INGLEWOOD/OU=EXCHANGE ADMINISTRATIVE GROUP 

(FYDI BOHF23SPDL T)/CN=RECI Pl ENTS/CN=E64293B3C478430CA 7B72F76D8AB0871-CH EL YL MOORE] 

7/30/2019 10:44:13 AM 

Mindala Wilcox [/o=lnglewood/ou=Exchange Administrative Group 

(FYDI BO HF 23SPDL T)/ cn=Recip ients/ en =b46bfd8a le 12482fb4f97 3bea2 ld23c4-M ind a I a Wi I cox] 

RE: Murphy's Bowl - Apporved 07 /23/19 

From: Mindala Wilcox 
Sent: Thursday, July 25, 2019 5:14 PM 
To: Cheryl Moore 
Cc: Cynthia Robinson 
Subject: RE: Murphy's Bowl - Apporved 07/23/19 

HI Cheryl, 
These have been requested and we will provide as soon as we receive. Thanks for checking in. 

Respectfu I ly, 

Mindy Wikox, AICP: Planning Manager: City of Inglewood 
Economic and Community Development Department 
Planning Division: One Manchester Boulevard: Inglewood, CA 90301 
V(310) 412-5230: F{310) 412-5681: _rJJ'.>'J_il_C:_()_)(_@_C:_i!Y_Qfi_Q_g_lgll'J_Q_Q_cJ_,Q_r_g_ 

ExcEllENCE in Public Service. CoMf\111Tf\11ENT to Problem Solving. DETERl\l11Ni\TION to Succeed. 

PLEASE CONSIDER THE El\l\llRONMEl\IT BEFORE PRll\ITll\IG THIS EMAIL 

From: Cheryl Moore 
Sent: Wednesday, July 24, 2019 1:46 PM 
To: Mindala Wilcox <mwilcox@cityofinglewood.org> 
Subject: Murphy's Bowl - Apporved 07 /23/19 

Good Afternoon Mindy, 

On Tuesday, July 23, 2019 City Council approved an agreement with Murphy's Bowl LLC. Would you please 

provide me with an original agreement, the one attached to the Staff Reports is a draft. 

I will also need original signatures and proof of insurance. Thank you, and if you need any help at all or 

have questions please do not hesitate to contact me. Have a great day. 

Cheryl Moore 
City Clerk's Office 
City of Inglewood 
(310) 412-4284 


